
Bid Item Manufacturer Part Number Description SAP # Estimated Quantity Unit Price Total Price Unit Price Total Price Unit Price Total Price Unit Price Total Price
L1-1 860-54-0041-16 Coupling, Hymax, 1.5, EPDM, 54,1.61-2.13 30651 30 133.28$ 3,998.40$ 119.35$ 3,580.50$ 119.63$ 3,588.90$ 120.92$ 3,627.60$
L1-2 860-54-0054-16 Coupling, Hymax, 2, EPDM, 54,2.1-3.03 24925 36 140.52$ 5,058.72$ 125.82$ 4,529.52$ 126.13$ 4,540.68$ 127.48$ 4,589.28$
L1-3 860-54-0108-16 Coupling, Hymax, 4, EPDM, 54,4.25-5.63 512 16 237.55$ 3,800.80$ 212.69$ 3,403.04$ 213.22$ 3,411.52$ 215.51$ 3,448.16$
L1-4 860-54-0163-16 Coupling, Hymax, 6, EPDM, 54,6.42-7.68 514 110 314.59$ 34,604.90$ 281.68$ 30,984.80$ 282.37$ 31,060.70$ 285.40$ 31,394.00$
L1-5 860-54-0217-16 Coupling, Hymax, 8, EPDM, 54,8.54-9.84 515 26 355.18$ 9,234.68$ 318.02$ 8,268.52$ 314.43$ 8,175.18$ 322.23$ 8,377.98$
L1-6 860-54-0278-16 Coupling, Hymax, 10, EPDM, 54,10.96-12.26 510 4 483.11$ 1,932.44$ 432.57$ 1,730.28$ 433.64$ 1,734.56$ 438.29$ 1,753.16$
L1-7 860-54-0334-16 Coupling, Hymax, 12, EPDM, 54,13.15-14.41 511 18 645.21$ 11,613.78$ 577.70$ 10,398.60$ 579.13$ 10,424.34$ 585.34$ 10,536.12$
L1-8 860-56-0434-16P Coupling, Hymax, 16, EPDM, 54, 17.10-19.20 32557 6 1,477.15$ 8,862.90$ 1,322.61$ 7,935.66$ 1,307.69$ 7,846.14$ 1,340.09$ 8,040.54$
L1-9 860-56-0540-16P Coupling, Hymax, 20, EPDM, 54,21.25-23.35 22771 6 1,876.74$ 11,260.44$ 1,680.39$ 10,082.34$ 1,661.43$ 9,968.58$ 1,702.61$ 10,215.66$
L1-10 860-56-0624-16P Coupling, Hymax, 24, EPDM, 54,24.60-26.70 22773 6 1,998.39$ 11,990.34$ 1,789.31$ 10,735.86$ 1,793.75$ 10,762.50$ 1,812.97$ 10,877.82$
L1-11 874-54-01004112 Flange Adapter, Hymax,Inch 1.5, 1.61-2.13 22778 4 144.91$ 579.64$ 129.75$ 519.00$ 130.07$ 520.28$ 131.46$ 525.84$
L1-12 874-54-02005412 Flange Adapter, Hymax,Inch 2, 2.10-3.03 22779 6 147.28$ 883.68$ 131.88$ 791.28$ 132.20$ 793.20$ 133.62$ 801.72$
L1-13 874-54-03008812 Flange Adapter, Hymax,Inch 3, 3.46-4.33 29620 6 209.38$ 1,256.28$ 187.48$ 1,124.88$ 187.94$ 1,127.64$ 189.95$ 1,139.70$
L1-14 874-54-04010812 Flange Adapter, Hymax,Inch 4, 4.25-5.63 29621 2 270.34$ 540.68$ 242.06$ 484.12$ 242.66$ 485.32$ 245.26$ 490.52$
L1-15 890-56-030080-16 Coupling, Grip, Hymax, 3, EPDM,3.15-3.74 30890 22 276.36$ 6,079.92$ 247.45$ 5,443.90$ 248.06$ 5,457.32$ 250.72$ 5,515.84$
L1-16 890-56-04111-16 Coupling, Grip, Hymax, 4, EPDM,4.40 - 5.10 29125 18 308.15$ 5,546.70$ 275.90$ 4,966.20$ 276.59$ 4,978.62$ 279.56$ 5,032.08$
L1-17 890-56-06165-16 Coupling, Grip, Hymax, 6, EPDM,6.50 - 7.20 29126 120 424.42$ 50,930.40$ 380.02$ 45,602.40$ 380.96$ 45,715.20$ 385.04$ 46,204.80$
L1-18 890-56-08216-16 Coupling, Grip, Hymax, 8, EPDM,8.50 - 9.40 29127 68 548.16$ 37,274.88$ 490.81$ 33,375.08$ 492.02$ 33,457.36$ 497.30$ 33,816.40$
L1-19 890-56-10270-16 Coupling, Grip, Hymax, 10, EPDM,10.65 - 11.55 29128 6 695.82$ 4,174.92$ 623.02$ 3,738.12$ 624.56$ 3,747.36$ 631.26$ 3,787.56$
L1-20 890-56-12322-16 Coupling, Grip, Hymax, 12, EPDM,12.68-13.39 29129 26 819.19$ 21,298.94$ 733.49$ 19,070.74$ 735.31$ 19,118.06$ 743.19$ 19,322.94$
L1-21 890-56-16438-17 Coupling, Grip, Hymax, 16, EPDM,17.25 - 17.88 32556 6 2,145.39$ 12,872.34$ 1,920.93$ 11,525.58$ 1,925.70$ 11,554.20$ 1,946.33$ 11,677.98$
L1-22 861540054008816 Coupling, Reducer/Transition, Hymax, 2 x 3, EPDM,2.1 - 4.33 32643 40 234.11$ 9,364.40$ 209.61$ 8,384.40$ 210.13$ 8,405.20$ 212.39$ 8,495.60$

253,160.18$ 226,674.82$ 226,872.86$ 229,671.30$
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Consolidated Pipe and Supply Co. Core & Main



Bid Item Manufacturer Part Number Description SAP # Estimated Quantity Unit Price Total Price Unit Price Total Price Unit Price Total Price Unit Price Total Price
L2-2 MACRO HP 2.9 Coupling, Romac, 2, EPDM, 2.12-2.9 none 36 no bid #VALUE! 175.55$ 6,319.80$ 151.80$ 5,464.80$ no bid #VALUE!
L2-3 MACRO HP 4.56 Coupling, Romac, 4, EPDM, 4.4-4.56 none 16 no bid #VALUE! 296.59$ 4,745.44$ 256.47$ 4,103.52$ no bid #VALUE!
L2-4 MACRO HP 7.6 Coupling, Romac, 6, EPDM, 6.6-7.6 none 110 no bid #VALUE! 391.40$ 43,054.00$ 338.46$ 37,230.60$ no bid #VALUE!
L2-5 MACRO HP 9.75 Coupling, Romac, 8, EPDM, 8.6-9.75 none 26 no bid #VALUE! 443.22$ 11,523.72$ 383.28$ 9,965.28$ no bid #VALUE!
L2-6 MACRO HP 11.9 Coupling, Romac, 10, EPDM, 10.7-11.9 none 4 no bid #VALUE! 573.32$ 2,293.28$ 488.23$ 1,952.92$ no bid #VALUE!
L2-7 MACRO HP 13.8 Coupling, Romac, 12, EPDM, 12.7-13.8 none 18 no bid #VALUE! 674.75$ 12,145.50$ 583.49$ 10,502.82$ no bid #VALUE!
L2-8 MACRO HP 19.2 Coupling, Romac, 16, EPDM, 17.1-19.2 none 6 no bid #VALUE! 1,848.61$ 11,091.66$ 1,598.61$ 9,591.66$ no bid #VALUE!
L2-16 ALPHA-A - 4.90 Coupling, Grip, Romac, 4, EPDM,4.50 - 4.90 none 18 no bid #VALUE! 371.24$ 6,682.32$ 321.04$ 5,778.72$ no bid #VALUE!
L2-17 ALPHA-A - 7.00 Coupling, Grip, Romac, 6, EPDM,6.60 - 7.00 none 120 no bid #VALUE! 511.32$ 61,358.40$ 442.17$ 53,060.40$ no bid #VALUE!
L2-18 ALPHA-A - 9.10 Coupling, Grip, Romac, 8, EPDM,8.60 - 9.10 none 68 no bid #VALUE! 660.40$ 44,907.20$ 571.09$ 38,834.12$ no bid #VALUE!
L2-19 ALPHA-A - 11.20 Coupling, Grip, Romac, 10, EPDM,10.75 - 11.20 none 6 no bid #VALUE! 838.30$ 5,029.80$ 724.93$ 4,349.58$ no bid #VALUE!
L2-20 ALPHA-A - 13.30 Coupling, Grip, Romac, 12, EPDM,12.75 - 13.30 none 26 no bid #VALUE! 986.95$ 25,660.70$ 853.47$ 22,190.22$ no bid #VALUE!

#VALUE! 234,811.82$ 203,024.64$ #VALUE!
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Bid Item Manufacturer Part Number Description SAP # Estimated Quantity Unit Price Total Price Unit Price Total Price Unit Price Total Price Unit Price Total Price
L3-2 Smith Blair Model 421 Coupling, Smith Blair, 2, EPDM, 2.13-2.95 none 36 no bid #VALUE! 117.99$ 4,247.64$ 120.02$ 4,320.72$ no bid #VALUE!
L3-3 Smith Blair Model 421 Coupling, Smith Blair, 4, EPDM, 4.46-5.6 none 16 no bid #VALUE! 195.29$ 3,124.64$ 198.66$ 3,178.56$ no bid #VALUE!
L3-4 Smith Blair Model 421 Coupling, Smith Blair, 6, EPDM, 6.56-7.6 none 110 no bid #VALUE! 257.85$ 28,363.50$ 262.30$ 28,853.00$ no bid #VALUE!
L3-5 Smith Blair Model 421 Coupling, Smith Blair, 8, EPDM, 8.54-9.85 none 26 no bid #VALUE! 292.00$ 7,592.00$ 297.05$ 7,723.30$ no bid #VALUE!
L3-6 Smith Blair Model 421 Coupling, Smith Blair, 10, EPDM, 10.64-11.83 none 4 no bid #VALUE! 371.55$ 1,486.20$ 400.49$ 1,601.96$ no bid #VALUE!
L3-7 Smith Blair Model 421 Coupling, Smith Blair, 12, EPDM, 12.62-13.67 none 18 no bid #VALUE! 454.00$ 8,172.00$ 549.68$ 9,894.24$ no bid #VALUE!

L3-13 Smith Blair Model 921 Flange Adapter, Smith Blair, Inch 3, 3.1-4.2 none 6 no bid #VALUE! 201.37$ 1,208.22$ 204.84$ 1,229.04$ no bid #VALUE!
L3-14 Smith Blair Model 921 Flange Adapter, Smith Blair, Inch 4, 4.46-5.60 none 2 no bid #VALUE! 260.00$ 520.00$ 264.50$ 529.00$ no bid #VALUE!

#VALUE! 54,714.20$ 57,329.82$ #VALUE!
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L3-23 All Others Not Listed All Others Not Listed Various no bid 15% 15% no bid
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